HEqo o I (9T,
HIZTH HTHT HI, FATCHT IS

ek, AfgcT HTedl, Halletd,

Hefg- oo o3,
fatin- ]9 |, R0%3.

TR -STHIA- R0 RR/M.56.2190/HA-R, - HERTS STHH Hege! UfedT, 1R&5
(RRE&E HET. 39.%¥2) =T HotH %37 AT Hetd 3¢, 3T Y& A
AT SATUHRIET o TeTed TH FHIOM=AT TR Fd SR AR He
"TERTSE STHA Feqel (YITRIRR -1 3707 Seueea™ YR shotedl Sl
AMTASRR -2 Hed T e0T) 99H,202R" ATHE GERUM FHI0ATIIR
TERTS YA GeAiel a0 SHoar JifsTel 378, o iedeaT shetd 33% =1,

Tle-He(}) BN TEvdeh STHCATIHI, TeX a9 Ja Uies v Sieial

e

o2. 7 FEHHT, "HERTE, STHIM Hedet (YITERIER aF1-R ST Areuge
TR Sheledl SITHAT TRTERIRR -3 Hed FUiaRid il (FEROM) H99,033"
3T 0T,

oR. "IERI. STH et (AIMTERR - AT HISUZS TS hefedl

ST TSR S-¢ Tedl TUiaia ot FEm, 3028 (3 Arqe "Wy Fem

TEU[A 3T0TE Shotell 3712.) 2T 9 3 Tedt Wieitel eRoT hvdTd 3 3T ,-

(?) 3U-FEE () T "TIeUed UM Shetedl” A1 HSGuas]

"AISUEEAH WRM holodl UHehd SIHATeAl YRMHM, &

ST Hed R TSt Feiel SR {& §ie, b JuTel SHleiaet
T AT T, BT AT STl SheudTd 5.

(?) 39-F9 (%) 7, -




) TeRATE ETeiteT TRk FHIES v I T -

"“I{.Q, HITIZIRY Elﬁ—? ST HISUCHITH USTT shefedl

S SAHAE WU FRUITARSAT  STeHear
THRT .2 hie] UeTl 21T Ad T, 3T JhIull T4

ST YEET=IT (STHIH T8 sheledT st T8 T

T TTS) e BRI, SealiaehR, 31em ST
TITEER T7-2 T SUTARUME ShivTda! 3TS9 IRId &

"I SUTEN 3T i, AFTERRR ol-3 ST2ET Hreqeea™
TR Sholedl YT ST, 3791 foatatd Teiol g
HR TSI Fedel STiR & hodTe [T U
YT SHTATSTE Yo7 SATATERIST, [STeaTerehR, 3T ST
TTITER -2 HE TUTARUM VTR TR IR e

R) TR -
() T=T (37)-

(2) TR A (3) I MYl 't g a1

ASTHAUSTSTT "aTel a9’ 8T TShY RIS 0T
D)

() T SHHTH (¥) JAieT IMEHHE ' aw’ a1

ASTHAUSTSTT "arel ' 8T TSIhY RIS 0T
PEC)




(&) IR (I)-

(2) THMT SHATH (3) JieT MUhEe "di au" a1

TSTEAIUSST "qrel aY' T AT Sl hRodTd
DE)

() THMT HHTE (¥) A2fieT TRt "di oy’ a1

ASEAUTST "UT AN’ B Fele] JrEgel YA
PR

03. I YW AT sTfeHeaTl IRy R v o
¥ &1 SIBUAT I 3R,

7
He &, o T T ?ﬂlé‘\’ll'_jﬂlq EEICIE
Digitally signed by SUNIL S KOTHEKAR
SUNIL S DN: CN = SUNIL'S KOTHEKAR, C = IN, S =
Mabharashtra, O = GOVERNMENT OF
MAHARASHTRA, OU = REVENUE AND

KOTH EKAR FORESTS DEPARTMENT

Date: 2023.03.28 19:13:56 +05'30"

(e HISHT)
37 Wi, WERTg 6T




Maharashtra
Land
Revenue
Code, 1966.

NOTIFICATION

Revenue and Forests Department,
Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg,
Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mumbai -400 032.

Dated the 27th March 2023.

No.Jamin-2021/C.R.170/J-1:- In exercise of the powers
conferred by sections 29A and 328 of the Maharashtra Land Revenue
Code, 1966 (Mah. XLI of 1966) and of all other powers enabling it in that
behalf, the Government of Maharashtra, hereby makes the following rules
to amend the Maharashtra Land Revenue (Conversion of Occupancy
Class-II and Leasehold lands into Occupancy Class-I lands) Rules, 2019,
the same having been previously published as required by sub-section (1)

of section 329 of the said Code, namely :-

1. These rules may be called the Maharashtra Land Revenue (Conversion
of Occupancy Class-Il and Leasehold lands into Occupancy Class-I
lands) (Amendment) Rules, 2023.

2. Inrule 3 of the Maharashtra Land Revenue (Conversion of
Occupancy Class-I1 and Leasehold lands into Occupancy Class-I lands)

Rules, 2019 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Rules”),-

(1) in sub-rule (1) for the words “leasehold basis” the words
“leasehold basis, after lapse of the period of five years from
the date of commencement of actual use of land for which the

land was granted originally,” shall be substituted;
(2) to sub-rule (4),-

(I) before the Table, the following provisos shall be inserted,
namely:-

“Provided that, the Collector shall not pass any order

to convert the Occupancy Class-II land or leasehold land

into Occupancy Class-I land in cases, where the premium

for such conversion exceeds rupees one crore unless prior



approval of the State Government (except the land granted

to Co-operative Housing Society), is obtained:

Provided further that, the Collector shall not pass
any order to convert the Occupancy Class-IlI land or
leasehold land into Occupancy Class-1 land only in such
cases where the period of five years from the date of
commencement of actual use of land for which the land

was granted originally has lapsed.”;
(1) in the Table,-
(a) in paragraph (A),-

(i) in column (3), in the heading, for the words “three

years” the words “five years” shall be substituted;

(if) in column (4), in the heading, for the words “three

years” the words “five years” shall be substituted;
(b) in paragraph (B),-

(i) in column (3), in the heading, for the words “three

years” the words “five years” shall be substituted;

(ii) in column (4), in the heading, for the words “three

years” the words “five years” shall be substituted.

3. Rule 4 of the principal Rules relating to adjustment of premium shall
be deleted.

By order and in the name of the
Governor of Maharashtra

tally signed by SUN\L S KOTHERAR

SUNIL S KOTHEKAR DN CN SUNILSKOTHEKAR c IN s=

1TRA,
ou = REVENUE AND FORESTS DEPARTMENT

Date: 2023.03.28 19:13:35 +05'30"

(Sunil Kothekar)

Deputy Secretary to Government.



		2023-03-28T19:13:35+0530
	SUNIL S KOTHEKAR


		2023-03-28T19:13:56+0530
	SUNIL S KOTHEKAR




